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One of the most influential and important composers of the twentieth century, Arnold Schoenberg
(1874–1951) brought remarkable new elements to modern music. His compositional style moved
progressively from lush, late Wagnerian chromaticism to a complete break with traditional tonality, later
organized theoretically as "composition with twelve hours." This systematic control of all pitches evolved
into a similar serialization of all of music's elements — a revolutionary advance that dominated international
compositions through most of this century.
This new volume presents two major early chamber works in an attractive study-score edition. The String
Quartet No. 1, Op. 7, while still showing the Wagnerian influence evident in such early masterpieces as
Verklärte Nacht, displays an advanced chromaticism that is developed even further in the String Quartet No.
2, Op. 10. More radical in its structure and harmonic design, this work pushes music to the brink of atonality,
pointing the way to Schoenberg's radical innovations. Even more striking in its design is the unexpected
addition of a soprano in the second quartet's third and fourth movements — settings of two poems by Stefan
George ("Litanei" and "Entrücking").
All students of twentieth-century music will want to add this attractive, authoritative edition to their library
of music scores.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Moore:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the concept String Quartets
Nos. 1 and 2 (Dover Chamber Music Scores) suitable to you? The particular book was written by well
known writer in this era. The particular book untitled String Quartets Nos. 1 and 2 (Dover Chamber Music
Scores)is the main of several books in which everyone read now. That book was inspired lots of people in
the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new age that you ever know before. The author
explained their thought in the simple way, so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book.
This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the
world in this particular book.

Rick Fairchild:

The book untitled String Quartets Nos. 1 and 2 (Dover Chamber Music Scores) contain a lot of information
on the item. The writer explains the girl idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to implement
all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored by famous author.
The author will take you in the new period of time of literary works. You can read this book because you can
keep reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you
want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice go through.

Morris Sampson:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and String Quartets Nos. 1 and 2
(Dover Chamber Music Scores) or others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the
good a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher as well as
students especially. Those publications are helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case, beside
science publication, any other book likes String Quartets Nos. 1 and 2 (Dover Chamber Music Scores) to
make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Joshua Miner:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source in which filled update of news. In
this particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book?
Or just seeking the String Quartets Nos. 1 and 2 (Dover Chamber Music Scores) when you essential it?
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