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Short-listed for the 2008 Red Maple Award

Keira, kidnapped from Ireland by Vikings, is a slave living in legendary Vinland. Two native bands, the
Beothuck and the Thule, are also fighting over the land, thrusting the Norsemen into war. While the Vikings
search for a new home, an accident at sea leaves Keira miraculously saved by a Beothuck warrior. Keira
settles into the Beothuck way of life, learning their customs and coming to care for them. But she dreams of
risking everything in order to find a way home. Ultimately, she is torn between the cultures in which she has
livedher homeland, the Viking world in which she was welcomed, and her new Beothuck family. This is a
thrilling adventure and an exciting introduction to the history of Canada.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Burke:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the
book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of guide
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The actual Stolen Away is kind of e-book which is
giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Noah Gardner:

The actual book Stolen Away has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of
gain. The book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research before write
this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can get the point easily after perusing this book.

David Dozier:

This Stolen Away is great book for you because the content which is full of information for you who have
always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This book reveal it data accurately using
great organize word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read the item hurriedly
you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but tough core
information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Stolen Away in your hand like having the world in
your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no e-book that offer you world with ten
or fifteen moment right but this reserve already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. active
do you still doubt that will?

Isabel Martin:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but also novel and Stolen Away or perhaps others sources were
given information for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel want to read more and
more. Science book was created for teacher or students especially. Those guides are helping them to add
their knowledge. In some other case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Stolen Away to make your
spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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