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From the author of SYMPATHY FOR THE DEVIL and PROHIBITION comes a riveting, gritty and
authentic novel of 1930's Manhattan.

NEW YORK CITY - August 1932 Caught between the Great Depression and a massive heatwave, New
York is a city on the edge. Businesses close up shop, breadlines grow longer and riots are almost a daily
occurrence. But when corrupt NYPD Detective Charlie Doherty is assigned to investigate a dead body in a
flophouse, he knows there's more here than meets the eye. He quickly discovers that the girl's death is tied to
one of the most powerful families in New York, and a kidnapping case that could tear the city apart. In a
chase that takes Doherty from the mansions of Fifth Avenue, to the slums of the Lower East Side, all the way
to City Hall itself, Doherty is in a race against time to find the people responsible for putting his city on a
slow burn.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Grimes:

The book Slow Burn make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable much more
increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem together with
your subject. If you can make reading a book Slow Burn being your habit, you can get a lot more advantages,
like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like open up and read a reserve Slow Burn. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that,
science reserve or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Peter Gomez:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV,
or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that's look different
you can read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent the entire day to reading a e-book. The book Slow Burn it is quite good to read. There are a lot of
people that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough
space to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book
through your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book possesses high quality.

James Mendoza:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Slow Burn that give your
enjoyment preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be
said as the means for people to know world better then how they react toward the world. It can't be explained
constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to end up being
success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit, you may pick Slow Burn
become your starter.

Joseph Yancey:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but also novel and Slow Burn or even others sources were given expertise
for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science guide was
created for teacher or students especially. Those guides are helping them to put their knowledge. In
additional case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Slow Burn to make your spare time a lot more
colorful. Many types of book like here.
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