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From the winner of the 2015 Man Booker International Prize

At long last, twenty-five years after the Hungarian genius László Krasznahorkai burst onto the scene with his
first novel, Satantango dances into English in a beautiful translation by George Szirtes.

Already famous as the inspiration for the filmmaker Béla Tarr’s six-hour masterpiece, Satantango is proof,
as the spellbinding, bleak, and hauntingly beautiful book has it, that “the devil has all the good times.”

The story of Satantango, spread over a couple of days of endless rain, focuses on the dozen remaining
inhabitants of an unnamed isolated hamlet: failures stuck in the middle of nowhere. Schemes, crimes,
infidelities, hopes of escape, and above all trust and its constant betrayal are Krasznahorkai’s meat. “At the
center of Satantango,” George Szirtes has said, “is the eponymous drunken dance, referred to here
sometimes as a tango and sometimes as a csardas. It takes place at the local inn where everyone is drunk. . . .
Their world is rough and ready, lost somewhere between the comic and tragic, in one small insignificant
corner of the cosmos. Theirs is the dance of death.”

“You know,” Mrs. Schmidt, a pivotal character, tipsily confides, “dance is my one weakness.”
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Kelly:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. These are
reading whatever they take because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem or even exercise.
Well, probably you will require this Satantango.

Mary Thomas:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information especially this Satantango book as this book offers
you rich details and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is
no doubt in it as you know.

Grace Godwin:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
will see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you
personally is Satantango this book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This
specific book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer require to
explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's
why this book appropriate all of you.

Patricia Dennis:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got students? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you also
know that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book. Many
kinds of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually Satantango.
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