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Every era has its merger; every era has its story. For the New Media age it was an even bigger disaster: the
AOL-Time Warner deal.

At the time AOL and Time Warner were considered a matchless combination of old media content and new
media distribution. But very soon after the deal was announced things started to go bad—and then from bad
to worse. Less than four years after the deal was announced, every significant figure in the deal -save the
politically astute Richard Parsons—has left the company, along with scores of others. Nearly a $100 billion
was written off and a stock that once traded at $100 now trades near $10.

What happened? Where did it all go wrong? In this deeply sourced and deftly written book, Nina Munk gives
us a window into the minds of two of the oddest men to ever run billion-dollar empires. Steve Case, the boy
wonder who built AOL one free floppy disk at a time, was searching for a way out of the New Economy. 
Meanwhile Jerry Levin, who'd made his reputation as a visionary when he put HBO on satellite distribution,
was searching for a monumental deal. These two men, more interested in their place in history than their
personal fortunes, each thought they were out-smarting the other.
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From reader reviews:

William Hoover:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book that
will improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want truly feel happy read
one with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the Fools Rush In is kind of publication which is
giving the reader unstable experience.

Derek McCaleb:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill
your free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book may be option to fill your totally free time/ holiday. The first
thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to consider look for book,
may be the guide untitled Fools Rush In can be great book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Daryl Steele:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to you personally is Fools Rush In this e-book consist a lot of the information of the condition
of this world now. This specific book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary
styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some exploration
when he makes this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.

Heather Bly:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside using friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Fools Rush In which is
obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.
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