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FERN WISHES SHE had normal parents and a normal name. Instead, she has eccentric botanist parents who
named her Fern, after her father’s favorite plant. Lily, Fern’s mother, assures her one day she’ll understand
their love of plants, but Fern can’t believe it. She hates plants and could do with less of them in her life.

Then Lily disappears suddenly while attending to a mysterious and rare Silver Rose. Fern and her dad are
heartbroken, but have no idea what could have happened, until one day, Fern learns she has a one-of-a-kind
talent: she can communicate with plants, and so could her mother! Using her newfound skill, she learns that
her mother is in terrible danger, and she is the only one who can save her. With a little help from her friends,
the plants . . .

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Norman Eiland:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled Fern Verdant and the Silver Rose. Try to make book Fern Verdant and the
Silver Rose as your close friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you feel alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book
makes you far more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we need to make
new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Alan Durham:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people have
do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by means of
surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Yes, by
reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is high. For yourself
who want to start reading any book, we give you this Fern Verdant and the Silver Rose book as starter and
daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Carol Sage:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book that
improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-book you read,
if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want truly feel happy
read one along with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The Fern Verdant and the Silver Rose is
kind of e-book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Tyler Emery:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their own reader with their story or
their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they write about the knowledge
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to their book. One of them is this
Fern Verdant and the Silver Rose.
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