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A fascinating study of Edward Hopper's iconic Nighthawks painting and its deep significance for
understanding American culture.

Staying up Much Too Late discusses the painting Nighthawks and the painter Edward Hopper and their
central importance to twentieth-century American culture. Topics include individualism, New York City,
Arthur "Weegee" Fellig, diners, pornography, capitalism, advertising, cigarettes, American philosophy,
World War II, Gravity's Rainbow, Blade Runner, Pulp Fiction, Russ Meyer, R. Crumb, David Lynch, and
film noir

What links these together is the painting's pessimistic take on American culture, which it also seems to
epitomize. Despite its desolate feel, Nighthawks has become a familiar icon, reproduced on posters and
postcards, in movies and on television shows. But Nighthawks is more than just a masterful painting. It is a
portal into that rarely acknowledged but pervasive dark side of the American psyche.
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From reader reviews:

Benjamin French:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book especially book entitled
Staying Up Much Too Late: Edward Hopper's Nighthawks and the Dark Side of the American Psyche your
brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe mysterious for but
surely can be your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a guide then become one application
form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get prior to. The Staying Up Much Too Late:
Edward Hopper's Nighthawks and the Dark Side of the American Psyche giving you an additional
experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful data for your better life in this
particular era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will be pleased
when you are finished looking at it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary
shelling out spare time activity?

Jennifer Bedard:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you
examine a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend
on what forms of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel,
comics, and soon. The Staying Up Much Too Late: Edward Hopper's Nighthawks and the Dark Side of the
American Psyche will give you new experience in examining a book.

Kristin Sayler:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is Staying Up Much Too Late: Edward Hopper's Nighthawks and the Dark
Side of the American Psyche this e-book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now.
This specific book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer
require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some investigation when he makes this book.
That is why this book suitable all of you.

Jean Gonzales:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you will get it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This specific Staying Up Much Too Late: Edward Hopper's
Nighthawks and the Dark Side of the American Psyche can give you a lot of close friends because by you



investigating this one book you have point that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This
specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This book offer you information that might be your
friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than additional make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate?
We should have Staying Up Much Too Late: Edward Hopper's Nighthawks and the Dark Side of the
American Psyche.
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