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An Up-to-Date Overview of the Theory and Practice Underlying Gifted Assessment

Essentials of Gifted Assessment introduces readers to the theory and practice underlying gifted assessment.
Steven Pfeiffer, a leading expert in the field of gifted assessment, discusses what it means to be gifted, why
we should identify gifted students, and the purposes of gifted assessment.

Well-organized and engaging, the book examines key principles of gifted assessment and provides an up-to-
date overview of gifted assessment measures. Topics include the use of local norms, measuring creativity
and motivation, nonverbal measures, the importance of recurring gifted assessment, multi-potentiality, gifted
testing and minority group students, and evaluating the twice-exceptional student. Early identification and
intervention greatly benefits gifted students, who may otherwise never realize their full potential. Throughout
the book, Pfeiffer equips school psychologists with the tools they need to:

Identify and assess uniquely bright and talented students●

Integrate multiple assessment measures including intelligence, cognitive ability, and achievement tests●

Assess gifted students with coexisting disabilities and disorders●

Promote the abilities of gifted students using evidence-based strategies●

The book also includes extensive illustrative material, such as callout boxes and case examples, that facilitate
use as a quick reference, plus end-of-chapter "Test Yourself" questions that help reinforce key concepts.
Essentials of Gifted Assessment helps new and seasoned school psychologists and other professionals acquire
the skills and knowledge needed for ethical, evidence-based, and informed clinical practice with high-ability
students.
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From reader reviews:

Nick McAllister:

Here thing why this particular Essentials of Gifted Assessment (Essentials of Psychological Assessment) are
different and dependable to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good however it depends in the
content from it which is the content is as delightful as food or not. Essentials of Gifted Assessment
(Essentials of Psychological Assessment) giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find
any book out there but there is no publication that similar with Essentials of Gifted Assessment (Essentials of
Psychological Assessment). It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing
which happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like
in park your car, café, or even in your approach home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the
published book maybe the form of Essentials of Gifted Assessment (Essentials of Psychological Assessment)
in e-book can be your option.

Alexandra Robbins:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Essentials of Gifted
Assessment (Essentials of Psychological Assessment), you could enjoy both. It is good combination right,
you still need to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout fellas. What? Still
don't have it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Danilo Ernest:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you study a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Essentials of Gifted Assessment (Essentials of Psychological Assessment) will give you new experience in
studying a book.

James Coles:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And
also you know that little person such as reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book. Amount types of books



that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these claims Essentials of Gifted Assessment
(Essentials of Psychological Assessment).
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