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Explores how a secret cabal of influential families has shaped the United States according to the principles of
sacred geometry and Goddess veneration

• Exposes the esoteric influences behind the National Grange Order of Husbandry

• Examines the sacred design and hidden purpose of the Washington Monument

• Reveals how the three obelisks in New York City depict the stars of Orion’s Belt

• Explains how every baseball diamond is actually a temple to the Goddess

In America: Nation of the Goddess, Alan Butler and Janet Wolter reveal how a secret cabal of influential
“Venus” families with a lineage tracing back to the Eleusinian Mysteries has shaped the history of the United
States since its founding. The evidence for such incredible assertions comes from American institutions such
as the National Grange Order of Husbandry and from the man-made landscape of the United States where
massive structures and whole cities conform to an agenda designed to elevate the feminine within religion
and society.

The authors explain how the Venus families, working through the Freemasons and later the Grange, planned
the American Revolution and the creation of the United States. It was this group who set the stage for the
Founding Fathers to create Washington, D.C., according to the principles of sacred geometry, with an eye
toward establishing the New Jerusalem. The authors explore the sacred design of the Washington
Monument, revealing its occult purpose and connections to the heavens. They reveal how the obelisks in
New York City depict the stars of Orion’s Belt just like the Giza pyramids and how the site of one of them,
St. Paul’s Chapel, is the American counterpart to Rosslyn Chapel in Scotland. Exposing the strong esoteric
influences behind the establishment of the Grange in the United States, they connect this apparently
conservative order of farmers to the Venus families and trace its lineage back to the Cisterians, who were a
major voice in the promotion of the Crusades and the establishment of the Knights Templar.

The authors conclude with the startling revelation that nearly every city in America has a temple to the
Goddess hidden in plain sight--their baseball diamonds--exposing the extent to which the Venus families are
still at work behind the scenes.
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From reader reviews:

John Bennett:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the reserve entitled America: Nation of the Goddess: The Venus Families and the Founding of
the United States. Try to make the book America: Nation of the Goddess: The Venus Families and the
Founding of the United States as your buddy. It means that it can to be your friend when you sense alone and
beside that course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you
considerably more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let us make new
experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Ellen Omalley:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book America: Nation of the
Goddess: The Venus Families and the Founding of the United States. All type of book can you see on many
sources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Norman Fuentes:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-book
way, more simple and reachable. This specific America: Nation of the Goddess: The Venus Families and the
Founding of the United States can give you a lot of friends because by you considering this one book you
have matter that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of
one step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't
understand, by knowing more than various other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let's have
America: Nation of the Goddess: The Venus Families and the Founding of the United States.

Dolores Mann:

That guide can make you to feel relax. That book America: Nation of the Goddess: The Venus Families and
the Founding of the United States was vibrant and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book
America: Nation of the Goddess: The Venus Families and the Founding of the United States has many kinds
or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think you are
the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it can make you feel
happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading in which.
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