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In Women and Substance Abuse: Gender Transparency you’ll see what can be done to aid women in some of
the world’s hardest hit substance abuse hubs, including Rio De Janeiro, Brazil; Philadelphia, Pennsylvania;
and New Haven, Connecticut. Filled with timely research and practical solutions, this volume shows you
what you can do to aid the tremendous and immediate need for specialized interventions in the lives of
women.Women and Substance Abuse considers many of the variables in the lives of women who abuse
drugs--race, choice of drug, HIV risk, and drug treatment history--and gives you line-by-line proof of the
need for custom-tailored harm reduction strategies for addicted women who are and who aren’t engaged in
drug treatment therapy. In addition, you’ll see why frequent cocaine use, current physical and sexual abuse,
and concerns relating to children can alter the success of therapies and treatments. Overall, this unique
volume will broaden your understanding of the subject by covering:

gender differences in risk for gonorrhea infection●

risk factors for women who trade sex for drugs and money●

the role of physicians and prenatal care providers of substance abusing women●

how drug treatment programs can be more multifacted to include planning, prenatal care, and parenting●

skills
prison-based therapeutic communities●

long-term residential treatment for women with children, pregnant women, and women without childrenFor●

every unique woman with a drug problem, there is a unique treatment. Women and Substance Abuse turns
away from the lost cause of blanket treatments and takes you into the world’s slums and inner-city
ghettoes, where the faces of addiction are as diverse as the women who bear its debilitating burdens. You’ll
see women’s drug addiction for what it is--a montage of suffering and pain that only individual and
specialized care can cure.
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From reader reviews:

William Martel:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And
you have free time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They must answer that question
mainly because just their can do in which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it
is correct. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this specific Women and Substance
Abuse: Gender Transparency to read.

Terrie Anderson:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Women and Substance Abuse:
Gender Transparency book because book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the details in this
book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Fred Garza:

The reason why? Because this Women and Substance Abuse: Gender Transparency is an unordinary book
that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will shock you with the secret this
inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such remarkable way
makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning fully. So , it
is good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This unique book will give
you a lot of benefits than the other book have such as help improving your expertise and your critical
thinking technique. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I have been you I will go to the
publication store hurriedly.

Katrice Fredericksen:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or make summary
for some publication, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's soul or real their hobby.
They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time there but nothing
reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see colorful pics
on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this period,
many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore
this Women and Substance Abuse: Gender Transparency can make you sense more interested to read.
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