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A revolutionary and empowering paradigm in treating addiction based on groundbreaking new science.

For decades addiction has been viewed and treated as a social and behavioral illness, afflicting people of
"weak" character and "bad" moral fiber. However, recent breakthroughs in genetic technology have enabled
doctors, for the first time, to correctly diagnose the disease and prove that addiction is an inherited, neuro-
chemical disease originating in brain chemistry, determined by genetics, and triggered by stress.

In their groundbreaking The Addiction Solution, David Kipper and Steven Whitney distill these exciting
findings into a guide for the millions of adults who want to be free from the cycle of addiction, and for their
loved ones who want to better understand it and to help. It draws on composite case histories to illustrate
how the innovative Personal Recovery Program works by customizing treatment for a diverse group of
addicts abusing a wide variety of different substances--from the first day of treatment to its successful
resolution. The result is a complete guide to a world made brand-new by this enormous paradigm shift in the
treatment of addiction.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Gagne:

The book The Addiction Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through Cutting-Edge Brain
Science make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable considerably more
increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem with your subject.
If you can make reading through a book The Addiction Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction
through Cutting-Edge Brain Science to become your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your
capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like
open up and read a guide The Addiction Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through Cutting-
Edge Brain Science. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or some others.
So , how do you think about this reserve?

Todd Jacob:

Here thing why this specific The Addiction Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through
Cutting-Edge Brain Science are different and reputable to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it
really depends in the content of computer which is the content is as tasty as food or not. The Addiction
Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through Cutting-Edge Brain Science giving you information
deeper since different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no publication that similar
with The Addiction Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through Cutting-Edge Brain Science. It
gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing this happened in
the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in park, café, or
even in your way home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the
form of The Addiction Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through Cutting-Edge Brain Science
in e-book can be your substitute.

Beverly McClendon:

The feeling that you get from The Addiction Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through
Cutting-Edge Brain Science is a more deep you searching the information that hide in the words the more
you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but The Addiction
Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through Cutting-Edge Brain Science giving you enjoyment
feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by means of
anyone who read the idea because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This specific book also
makes your vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-
book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this particular The Addiction
Solution: Unraveling the Mysteries of Addiction through Cutting-Edge Brain Science instantly.



Jack Caldwell:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Addiction Solution: Unraveling the
Mysteries of Addiction through Cutting-Edge Brain Science, you can enjoy both. It is great combination
right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout fellas.
What? Still don't have it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.
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