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The exciting tale of a young gambler, a horse, and the bond that will change the both of them forever.

Hoping to make a man out of him, Alfred Larribee’s father sends his son to live with his cousin’s family out
West. Alfred is lazy and listless, and spends his early days there drinking, gambling, and doing everything he
can to avoid his share of work.

Everything changes with the appearance of Sky Blue, a magnificent stallion that seemingly can’t be ridden
and has seriously injured one of the few willing to try. But to everyone’s astonishment, Larribee is able to
bond with the horse, mount him, and ride him with ease.

Josiah Ransome is already at odds with Larribee over his gambling when the woman he hopes to marry bets
her emerald ring that Larribee will not able to ride Sky Blue. When the opportunity presents itself, Ransome
turns to sabotage, placing a burr under the horse’s saddle. When Larribee mounts the stallion again he is
viciously thrown off, and Sky Blue flees off into the desert.

Larribee sets out on a mission, blazing a trail through dangerous Indian territory to find Sky Blue and return
the horse to its home. Sky Blue is the story of Larribee’s journey into the wild frontier, and a captivating
Western from one of the genre’s all-time greats!

Skyhorse Publishing is proud to publish a broad range of books for readers interested in fiction that takes
place in the old West. Westerns—books about outlaws, sheriffs, chiefs and warriors, cowboys and
Indians—are a genre in which we publish regularly. Our list includes international bestselling authors like
Zane Gray and Louis L’Amour, and many more. While not every title we publish becomes a New York
Times bestseller or a national bestseller, we are committed to books on subjects that are sometimes
overlooked and to authors whose work might not otherwise find a home.
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From reader reviews:

Roger Ruelas:

This book untitled Sky Blue: A Western Story to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, this
is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this particular
book in the book retail outlet or you can order it via online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It
makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is
no reason for your requirements to past this book from your list.

Gayle Collins:

Typically the book Sky Blue: A Western Story has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this book
you can get a lot of benefit. The book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes
some research before write this book. This book very easy to read you will get the point easily after scanning
this book.

Tammy Robinson:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled Sky Blue: A Western Story your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most
aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a
e-book then become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get before. The
Sky Blue: A Western Story giving you an additional experience more than blown away your brain but also
giving you useful details for your better life in this particular era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern
is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a game. Do
you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Avis Marguez:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, small story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Sky Blue: A Western
Story that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading routine all
over the world can be said as the means for people to know world a great deal better then how they react
towards the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky particular person but
for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start looking at as your good
habit, you can pick Sky Blue: A Western Story become your personal starter.
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