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Jack's a retired ex-cop from New York, seeking the simple life in Cherringham. Sarah's a Web designer
who's moved back to the village find herself. But their lives are anything but quiet as the two team up to
solve Cherringham's criminal mysteries.

-- This compilation contains episodes 1 - 3: MURDER ON THAMES, MYSTERY AT THE MANOR and
MURDER BY MOONLIGHT. Here Jack and Sarah investigate a suicide in the River Thames - or was it
murder? They investigate an "accidental" fire with deadly consequences, and they nab the culprit behind the
Rotary Club choir poisoning.

-- Cherringham is a serial novel à la Charles Dickens, with a new mystery thriller released each month. Set in
the sleepy English village of Cherringham, the detective series brings together an unlikely sleuthing duo:
English web designer Sarah and American ex-cop Jack. Thrilling and deadly - but with a spot of tea - it's like
Rosamunde Pilcher meets Inspector Barnaby. Each of the self-contained episodes is a quick read for the
morning commute, while waiting for the doctor, or when curling up with a hot cuppa.

-- For fans of Agatha Christie's Miss Marple series, Lilian Jackson Braun's The Cat Who series, Caroline
Graham's Midsomer Murders, and the American TV series Murder She Wrote, starring Angela Lansbury.

-- Co-authors Neil Richards (based in the UK) and Matthew Costello (based in the US), are known for their
script work on major computer games. The Cherringham crime series is their first fictional transatlantic
collaboration.
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From reader reviews:

Kerry Diaz:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be reading whatever
they consider because their hobby is actually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you should have this Cherringham - Episode 1 - 3: A Cosy Crime Series Compilation
(Cherringham: Crime Series Compilations).

Darren Billups:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind
of e-book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want sense happy
read one with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Typically the Cherringham - Episode 1 - 3: A
Cosy Crime Series Compilation (Cherringham: Crime Series Compilations) is kind of reserve which is
giving the reader erratic experience.

Noah Gardner:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Cherringham - Episode 1 - 3: A Cosy Crime
Series Compilation (Cherringham: Crime Series Compilations), you are able to enjoy both. It is excellent
combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout
fellas. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Macie Tiffany:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got students? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also you
know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the point. Book is important thing to include you knowledge,
except your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by
book. Numerous books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is Cherringham - Episode 1
- 3: A Cosy Crime Series Compilation (Cherringham: Crime Series Compilations).
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