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A real-world guide to Attachment Parenting from the Big Bang Theory actress, neuroscientist, and mother
Mayim Bialik—a book hailed by Dr. William Sears as “delightful” and by Ricki Lake as “a fantastic guide to
birth and parenting that is packed with invaluable wisdom.”

Mayim Bialik was the child star of the popular 1990s TV sitcom Blossom, but she definitely didn’t follow
the typical child-star trajectory. Instead, Mayim got her PhD in neuroscience from UCLA, married her
college sweetheart, and had two kids. Mayim then did what many new moms do—she read a lot of books,
talked with other parents, and she soon started questioning a lot of the conventional wisdom she heard about
the “right” way to raise a child. That’s when she turned to Attachment Parenting, a philosophy and lifestyle
popularized by well-known physicians like Dr. William Sears and Dr. Jay Gordon.

To Mayim, Attachment Parenting’s natural, child-led approach not only felt right emotionally, it made sense
intellectually and instinctually. She found that when she followed her intuition and relaxed into her role as a
mother instead of following some rigid parenting script, both she and her children thrived. Taking into
account her experience as a mother (and her scientific background), Mayim presents the major tenets of
Attachment Parenting, including:

Baby wearing: How to “wear” your baby in a sling or a wrap to foster a closer bond with your child—it’s
possible even for mamas with bad backs (and with big babies)!

Breastfeeding: Learn how to listen to your baby’s cues rather than sticking to a rigid schedule—and why
people on airplanes love a nursing mother!

Gentle discipline: How to get your child to behave without yelling, threats, or time-outs—it really is
possible.

Co-sleeping: How to avoid “sleep training” and get a great night’s sleep for the whole family.

Without the pretense and luxuries typical of so many Hollywood actors and parents, Mayim describes the
beauty, simplicity, and purposefulness of Attachment Parenting, and how it’s become the guiding principle
for her family. Much more than a simple how-to parenting guide, Beyond the Sling shows us that the core
principles underlying Attachment Parenting are universal and can be appreciated no matter how you decide
to raise your child.
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From reader reviews:

Timothy Rowe:

What do you regarding book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy individual? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And
you have free time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They must answer that question
due to the fact just their can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
correct. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this particular Beyond the Sling: A
Real-Life Guide to Raising Confident, Loving Children the Attachment Parenting Way to read.

Ginger Beals:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the headline Beyond the
Sling: A Real-Life Guide to Raising Confident, Loving Children the Attachment Parenting Way suitable to
you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in this era. Typically the book untitled Beyond
the Sling: A Real-Life Guide to Raising Confident, Loving Children the Attachment Parenting Wayis one of
several books which everyone read now. This book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read
this e-book you will enter the new shape that you ever know before. The author explained their idea in the
simple way, so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this publication. This book will give you a lot
of information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world with this book.

Jerry Petrus:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of various ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, studying a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the people
do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this Beyond the
Sling: A Real-Life Guide to Raising Confident, Loving Children the Attachment Parenting Way, it is
possible to tells your family, friends and soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire different
ones, make them reading a reserve.

Thomas Morgan:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will
make you to definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended for you is Beyond the Sling: A Real-Life Guide to Raising Confident, Loving Children



the Attachment Parenting Way this e-book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now.
This particular book was represented how do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer
require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes this book.
This is why this book suited all of you.
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