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Since booze and prohibition have made criminals out of every man in her world, Laurie Burke resolves to
find at least one honorable man to fill her life. Convinced that handsome newcomer Daniel Shepherd is
connected with her brother’s rum-running gang, Laurie quickly scratches his name off her list. Daniel has
mixed feelings about returning to the dirty mill town of his youth, but grudgingly agrees to manage his
grandfather’s drug store until a replacement can be found. The moment he meets Laurie on the windswept
bluff overlooking the beach, he knows that if he can earn her love, he might have a reason to stay. But when
Laurie pushes him away--for none other than Federal Agent Samuel Brown--Daniel wonders if Laurie really
is the upstanding woman he thought her to be. The Strait of Juan de Fuca, just off the beaches of Port
Angeles, Washington, was treacherous water for reckless rum-runners—and the agents who tried to catch
them. So when she realizes her brother is in danger, romance is the last thing on Laurie's mind. Yet the
people she believes she can trust, may not be so honorable after all.
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From reader reviews:

Rosalie Dietrich:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A e-book Mistaken: First Impressions Are Never
What They Seem will make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about
almost everything. But some of you think this open or reading any book make you bored. It isn't make you
fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or acceptable book with you?

Martha Holt:

This book untitled Mistaken: First Impressions Are Never What They Seem to be one of several books in
which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit on it. You
will easily to buy this book in the book retail outlet or you can order it through online. The publisher on this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Billy Taylor:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their own reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the ability
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their expertise in
writing, they also doing some research before they write to the book. One of them is this Mistaken: First
Impressions Are Never What They Seem.

Phyllis Wilder:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find publication that need more
time to be examine. Mistaken: First Impressions Are Never What They Seem can be your answer given it
can be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.
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