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Acclaimed in his own time, Captain Randolph B. Marcy—trailblazer, geographer, fighter in the Mexican
War, American Indian authority, and author—traveled as extensively as any other nineteenth-century
explorer. Yet Marcy has not achieved the fame of Lewis and Clark, Pike, Long, or Frémont, although he was
the first to trace the Red River, in 1852.

Marcy conducted five major expeditions through the West and drafted the first reasonably accurate maps of
the Southwest. His advice to his military superiors led to the establishment of the chain of “Cross Timbers”
forts from Fort Smith to New Mexico, including Forts Arbuckle, Belknap, and Sill, and the location of a
number of Indian reservations. During the Mormon War Marcy led a dramatic march over 634 miles of
snow-covered mountains to New Mexico to obtain relief supplies for isolated Fort Bridger, Wyoming.

Beyond the Cross Timbers: The Travels of Randolph B. Marcy  brings Marcy’s adventures to light, tracing
his fifty years of army service and his epic journeys of exploration. W. Eugene Hollon utilized Marcy’s
books, official Washington files, and the unpublished personal correspondence of the Marcy and McClellan
families to present a graphic picture of nineteenth-century army life at lonely frontier posts, and the trials
faced by the band of intrepid wives who followed their soldier husbands into the wilderness. Hollon also
includes the story of the wooing and winning of daughter Mary Ellen Marcy by young Lieutenant George B.
McClellan, who was to become his father-in-law’s commanding officer during the Civil War and Lincoln’s
opponent in the 1864 election.
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From reader reviews:

Troy Ethridge:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called Beyond the
Cross Timbers: The Travels of Randolph B. Marcy? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You already
know beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree
with their opinion or you have additional opinion?

Robert Brown:

The book Beyond the Cross Timbers: The Travels of Randolph B. Marcy gives you the sense of being enjoy
for your spare time. You should use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your best
friend when you getting stress or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book
Beyond the Cross Timbers: The Travels of Randolph B. Marcy to be your habit, you can get much more
advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. It is possible to
know everything if you like open and read a e-book Beyond the Cross Timbers: The Travels of Randolph B.
Marcy. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do
you think about this reserve?

Susan Jun:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you read a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Beyond the Cross Timbers: The Travels of Randolph B. Marcy will give you a new experience in reading
through a book.

Mary Wines:

This Beyond the Cross Timbers: The Travels of Randolph B. Marcy is new way for you who has curiosity to
look for some information given it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you into it getting
knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having little digest in reading this Beyond the Cross
Timbers: The Travels of Randolph B. Marcy can be the light food in your case because the information
inside this specific book is easy to get by anyone. These books create itself in the form that is reachable by
anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in book form make them feel
sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is no in reading a reserve especially this one. You
can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book



sort for your better life and also knowledge.
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