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Moving Lessons is an insightful and sophisticated look at the origins and influence of dance in American
universities, focusing on Margaret H'Doubler, who established the first university courses and the first
degree program in dance (at the University of Wisconsin). Dance educator and historian Janice Ross shows
that H'Doubler (1889–1982) was both emblematic of her time and an innovator who made deep imprints in
American culture. An authentic "New Woman," H'Doubler emerged from a sheltered female Victorian world
to take action in the public sphere. She changed the way Americans thought, not just about female
physicality but also about higher education for women.

    Ross brings together many discourses—from dance history, pedagogical theory, women's history, feminist
theory, American history, and the history of the body—in intelligent, exciting, and illuminating ways and
adds a new chapter to each of them. She shows how H'Doubler, like Isadora Duncan and other modern
dancers, helped to raise dance in the eyes of the middle class from its despised status as lower-class
entertainment and "dangerous" social interaction to a serious enterprise. Taking a nuanced critical approach
to the history of women's bodies and their representations, Moving Lessons fills a very large gap in the
history of dance education.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Martinez:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a go walking,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book called Moving Lessons: Margaret
H'Doubler and the Beginning of Dance in American Education? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You
understand beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you
agree with it has the opinion or you have other opinion?

Frank Johnson:

The book Moving Lessons: Margaret H'Doubler and the Beginning of Dance in American Education make
you feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to
become your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem with your subject. If you can make
examining a book Moving Lessons: Margaret H'Doubler and the Beginning of Dance in American Education
being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about
some or all subjects. You may know everything if you like available and read a reserve Moving Lessons:
Margaret H'Doubler and the Beginning of Dance in American Education. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means
that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Aaron Tolleson:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside
the book which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want experience
happy read one along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the Moving
Lessons: Margaret H'Doubler and the Beginning of Dance in American Education is kind of guide which is
giving the reader erratic experience.

Dianne Roy:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
can observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended to
your account is Moving Lessons: Margaret H'Doubler and the Beginning of Dance in American Education
this e-book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This specific book was
represented so why is the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use for explain it is easy to
understand. The actual writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That is why this book suited all



of you.
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