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Geared toward English and social studies teachers as well as school librarians, this book provides a clear and
concise way to approach the teaching of persuasive writing—and to develop the skills students need to excel
on high stakes tests as well.

• Card graphics that make following the model easy to follow

• Appendices providing mnemonics, registers of language, sample persuasive theses, and the major fallacies
students use in their writing
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From reader reviews:

Brandy Hagaman:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yep, you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book allowed Four by Four:
Practical Methods for Writing Persuasively? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You understand
beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do
you agree with their opinion or you have some other opinion?

Marianne Guzman:

The feeling that you get from Four by Four: Practical Methods for Writing Persuasively is the more deep you
excavating the information that hide into the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to recognise but Four by Four: Practical Methods for Writing Persuasively giving
you excitement feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in selected way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this reserve is well-known enough.
This particular book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then
can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this particular Four
by Four: Practical Methods for Writing Persuasively instantly.

Sandra Conaway:

The particular book Four by Four: Practical Methods for Writing Persuasively has a lot details on it. So when
you read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was compiled by the very famous author. This articles
author makes some research before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the
point easily after reading this book.

Damian Woodward:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is written or printed or created from each source that filled update of news. In this particular
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just looking for
the Four by Four: Practical Methods for Writing Persuasively when you necessary it?
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