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The gritty, riveting, highly anticipated sequel to the national (and international) best seller Ghostman,
by the critically acclaimed and award-winning Roger Hobbs

It’s just before dawn on the South China Sea when three experienced pirates open fire on a small smuggling
yacht. Their target: a bag of uncut sapphires worth millions. But when one of them stumbles across an
enormous treasure that wasn’t on the manifest, everything goes sideways. Within minutes two of them are
dead, leaving the third, a coldblooded psychopath, to claim both the sapphires and the mysterious windfall
for himself. If he disappears, he won’t just be wealthy. He’ll have the power to change the course of history.

His boss, Angela, isn’t about to let that happen. She calls in a favor from her onetime protégé: a fixer
sometimes known as Jack, or more often as simply the Ghostman. Within hours he’s flying halfway around
the world to find her in the glimmering neon slums of Macau. Jack has no real name, no address and no
fingerprints—but given the right motivation, he can make serious problems vanish. Though the two haven’t
talked since they botched a job six years ago, as soon as Jack’s off the plane they’re back together again,
facing down a crime boss, a hit man and a conspiracy bigger than anything they’ve ever encountered and
more dangerous than they could’ve imagined.

Their partnership—between people with no lasting relationships whatsoever—is at the very heart of a novel
that will cement Roger Hobbs’s status as one of our most talented crime writers.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Matt Cresswell:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Vanishing Games: A novel. Try to make book Vanishing
Games: A novel as your friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you sense alone and beside
regarding course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes
you considerably more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , we need to make new
experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Darren Billups:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book eligible Vanishing Games:
A novel? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with your
favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have other opinion?

Luke Palmieri:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book Vanishing Games: A novel. All
type of book can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Alice Black:

E-book is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the update information of year to be able to year. As
we know those ebooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to
around the world. With the book Vanishing Games: A novel we can take more advantage. Don't one to be
creative people? Being creative person must want to read a book. Just choose the best book that appropriate
with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this book Vanishing Games: A novel. You can
more inviting than now.
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