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Johann Wolfgang von Goethe was a German writer and statesman. His body of work includes epic and lyric
poetry written in a variety of metres and styles; prose and verse dramas; memoirs; an autobiography; literary
and aesthetic criticism; treatises on botany, anatomy, and colour; and four novels. In addition, numerous
literary and scientific fragments, more than 10,000 letters, and nearly 3,000 drawings by him are extant. A
literary celebrity by the age of 25, Goethe was ennobled by the Duke of Saxe-Weimar, Karl August in 1782
after first taking up residence there in November 1775 following the success of his first novel, The Sorrows
of Young Werther. He was an early participant in the Sturm und Drang literary movement. During his first
ten years in Weimar, Goethe served as a member of the Duke's privy council, sat on the war and highway
commissions, oversaw the reopening of silver mines in nearby Ilmenau, and implemented a series of
administrative reforms at the University of Jena. He also contributed to the planning of Weimar's botanical
park and the rebuilding of its Ducal Palace, which in 1998 were together designated a UNESCO World
Heritage Site. Arthur Schopenhauer cited Wilhelm Meister's Apprenticeship as one of the four greatest
novels ever written, along with Tristram Shandy, La Nouvelle Heloise, and Don Quixote, and Ralph Waldo
Emerson selected Goethe as one of six "representative men" in his work of the same name, along with Plato,
Napoleon, and William Shakespeare. Goethe's comments and observations form the basis of several
biographical works, most notably Johann Peter Eckermann's Conversations with Goethe. There are frequent
references to Goethe's writings throughout the works of G. W. F. Hegel, Arthur Schopenhauer, Friedrich
Nietzsche, Hermann Hesse, Thomas Mann, Sigmund Freud, and Carl Jung. Goethe's poems were set to
music throughout the eighteenth and nineteenth centuries by a number of composers, including Wolfgang
Amadeus Mozart, Ludwig van Beethoven, Franz Schubert, Robert Schumann, Johannes Brahms, Charles
Gounod, Richard Wagner, Hugo Wolf, Felix Mendelssohn, and Gustav Mahler.
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Hollander:

The book Stella: A Tragedy give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your
capable far more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem
together with your subject. If you can make studying a book Stella: A Tragedy to get your habit, you can get
a lot more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all
subjects. You could know everything if you like open and read a guide Stella: A Tragedy. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Elliott Preciado:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider when those
information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously which one works
to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then you get it as
your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will not happen with
you if you take Stella: A Tragedy as the daily resource information.

Arthur McLaurin:

The reserve with title Stella: A Tragedy has lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of
help after read this book. That book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this guide represented
the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world.
This kind of book will bring you within new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on the
smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Audrey Spence:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book?
Or just searching for the Stella: A Tragedy when you required it?
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