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Wouldn’t it be great if you could be audaciously ambitious and happy at the same time?
You can, and you will.

“I’m here to tell you that all of your priorities—personal and ambitious career goals alike—can fit together
harmoniously. I’ll show you how, like thousands of women I’ve worked with over the years, you can make
more money, earn the credit and recognition you deserve, have more power, and be as ambitious as you want
to be. I’ll show you how you can be ambitious without compromising your ethics and integrity. I’ll show you
that you can feel worthy and entitled to all of this without fear that you risk sacrificing your desire to have a
full, happy personal life and without being afraid that you’ll be less of a woman. It’s worked for me. It’s
worked for countless ambitious women I’ve advised. It will work for you.”
—From Ambition is Not a Dirty Word: A Woman's Guide to Earning Her Worth and Achieving Her Dreams

We women aren’t advancing in our careers the way we should. We’re not making the money we deserve or
getting the fulfillment we desire. And this time it’s not men who are holding us back. This time we’re doing
it to ourselves, because ambition—for us—is still a dirty word.

Debra Condren has coached thousands of women at every level—from those just starting out to the most
powerful female executives in the United States—and each one possesses the same fear: if she goes after her
dream, she’ll be seen as selfish, bitchy, a bad wife, or bad mother. But it’s exactly this fear of ambition that
has forced women to leave the best part of themselves—their dreams, their great talents—by the roadside,
rendering them less able to be the whole people they should be in every area of their lives.

Condren has a new message and mission: to remind women that ambition is a virtue, not a vice. Ambition is
the best of who we are.

The real way to have a great life is to see ambition as a part of your value system to which you must give
equal attention, along with the other priorities you hold dear, including your spouse, your children, and your
friends. In Ambition is Not a Dirty Word, Dr. Condren offers fresh, powerful tools for reclaiming your
dreams. Her eight Ambitious Rules provide concrete, innovative solutions to the everyday struggles we as
women face, like taking credit, deflecting detractors, and handling confrontation, so that you can become
more powerful and fulfilled at work and more satisfied at home. You can redefine your ambition in the face
of social sanctions and unapologetically go after your dreams without sacrificing the rest of your life.

You owe it to yourself and the world to make the contribution you were born to make. Debra Condren will
show you how to do it.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Wadsworth:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time
to take a wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book allowed
Ambition Is Not a Dirty Word: A Woman's Guide to Earning Her Worth and Achieving Her Dreams? Maybe
it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book,
you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have additional opinion?

James Newman:

This Ambition Is Not a Dirty Word: A Woman's Guide to Earning Her Worth and Achieving Her Dreams is
brand new way for you who has fascination to look for some information given it relief your hunger
associated with. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still
having bit of digest in reading this Ambition Is Not a Dirty Word: A Woman's Guide to Earning Her Worth
and Achieving Her Dreams can be the light food for you because the information inside that book is easy to
get simply by anyone. These books produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the
e-book application form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel tired even dizzy this guide is
the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a book especially this one. You can find actually looking for.
It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book style for your better life and also
knowledge.

Bert Martinez:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This reserve Ambition Is Not a Dirty Word: A Woman's Guide to Earning Her Worth and
Achieving Her Dreams was filled about science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your
scientific disciplines competence. Some people has different feel when they reading a book. If you know
how big selling point of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like now, many
ways to get book that you wanted.

Robert Oshea:

As a university student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or
even make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart
and soul or real their hobby. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
presently there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring along with
can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As
we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach



Chinese's country. Therefore , this Ambition Is Not a Dirty Word: A Woman's Guide to Earning Her Worth
and Achieving Her Dreams can make you sense more interested to read.
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