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The market for commercial beauty products exploded in Third Republic France, with a proliferation of goods
promising to erase female imperfections and perpetuate an aesthetic of femininity that conveyed health and
respectability. While the industry's meteoric growth helped to codify conventional standards of womanhood,
The Force of Beauty goes beyond the narrative of beauty culture as a tool for sociopolitical subjugation to
show how it also targeted women as important consumers in major markets and created new avenues by
which they could express their identities and challenge or reinforce gender norms.

As cosmetics companies and cultural media, from magazines to novels to cinema, urged women to aspire to
commercial standards of female perfection, beauty evolved as a goal to be pursued rather than a biological
inheritance. The products and techniques that enabled women to embody society's feminine ideal also taught
them how to fashion their bodies into objects of desire and thus offered a subversive tool of self-expression.
Holly Grout explores attempts by commercial beauty culture to reconcile a standard of respectability with
female sexuality, as well as its efforts to position French women within the global phenomenon of changing
views on modern womanhood.

Grout draws on a wide range of primary sources-hygiene manuals, professional and legal debates about the
right to fabricate and distribute "medicines," advertisements for beauty products, and contemporary fiction
and works of art-to explore how French women navigated changing views on femininity. Her seamless
integration of gender studies with business history, aesthetics, and the history of medicine results in a
textured and complex study of the relationship between the politics of womanhood and the politics of beauty.
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From reader reviews:

William Phillips:

This The Force of Beauty: Transforming French Ideas of Femininity in the Third Republic tend to be reliable
for you who want to become a successful person, why. The key reason why of this The Force of Beauty:
Transforming French Ideas of Femininity in the Third Republic can be among the great books you must have
is giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed anyone with information that possibly will
shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and
whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed people. Beside that this The Force of Beauty:
Transforming French Ideas of Femininity in the Third Republic forcing you to have an enormous of
experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day
activity. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Tanya Minor:

Often the book The Force of Beauty: Transforming French Ideas of Femininity in the Third Republic will
bring you to definitely the new experience of reading a book. The author style to describe the idea is very
unique. When you try to find new book you just read, this book very ideal to you. The book The Force of
Beauty: Transforming French Ideas of Femininity in the Third Republic is much recommended to you you
just read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Jose Pina:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the spare time or they will get great deal
of stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the
actual book you have read is definitely The Force of Beauty: Transforming French Ideas of Femininity in the
Third Republic.

Susan Bondurant:

The book untitled The Force of Beauty: Transforming French Ideas of Femininity in the Third Republic
contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy method. The
language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The
book was published by famous author. The author brings you in the new era of literary works. You can
actually read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book
with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in
addition to order it. Have a nice examine.
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