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In this companion volume to the well-known Aristotle Dictionary, Morris Stockhammer offers a
comprehensive and alphabetically organized glossary of the basic writings of Plato. For many years, the
editor scanned through the dialogues of Plato in an effort to find and collect those pithy thoughts that
represent the essence of Platonism. The perfect dictionary for philosophers and students of ancient
philosophy, the Plato Dictionary includes explanations, definitions, and explications of Plato’s vocabulary
often using his own words to complete the description. Each entry also includes a citation from Plato’s
indispensible oeuvre. Morris Stockhammer was a lexicographer and historian known for his subject
dictionaries on famous philosophers including Immanuel Kant, Plato, Karl Marx, and Thomas Aquinas. He
also published on European economics and history.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Wimmer:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Plato Dictionary book written by well-
known writer we are excited for well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who have
read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and writing skill only for
eliminate your hunger then you still doubt Plato Dictionary as good book not only by the cover but also
through the content. This is one book that can break don't evaluate book by its cover, so do you still needing
an additional sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told you so why
you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Linda Matthews:

You may spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This Plato Dictionary is simple to bring you can
read it in the area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have much space to bring the printed
book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save typically the book in
your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Carolyn Berndt:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Plato Dictionary can be the respond to, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely
new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Stacia Cobb:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of several books in the
top list in your reading list is actually Plato Dictionary. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can
get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this guide you can get many
advantages.
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