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One of the most memorable creative personalities of the Baroque age and arguably the most forcefully
expressive and influential woman painter in history, the Roman-born Artemisia Gentileschi (1593–1652/3)
has become the central figure in the recovery of the history of art produced by women. Applying a rigorous
methodology, this profusely illustrated study with interpretative text and catalogue raisonné embeds
Gentileschi’s pictorially and emotionally compelling pictures within the actual sociocultural contexts in and
for which they were created.

The interpretive text analyzes key pictures and primary literary evidence to reveal the sweep of Artemisia’s
oeuvre, chart her travels, define her standing with artists and patrons of the period, investigate the links
between her financial situations and the artistic decisions that she made, and assess the validity of proposals
regarding her activity as a still-life painter, her access to professional organizations, her level of literacy, and
the nature of her subject matter. Exploring the question of the interrelationships among Gentileschi’s gender
and experiences as a woman, the state of her psyche, and her art, the text also confronts—and often
challenges—the widely embraced feminist interpretation of her pictures.

Many of the conclusions in the text are supported by an extensive register of archival documents and by the
very core of the study: the first and only catalogue raisonné of Artemisia’s autograph works, each of the
fifty-seven pictures exhaustively investigated as to basic factual information, condition and color,
iconography, history, documentation and dating, existing copies, and bibliography. Catalogues of
misattributed and lost paintings complete this comprehensive volume.
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From reader reviews:

John McCraw:

This book untitled Artemisia Gentileschi and the Authority of Art: Critical Reading and Catalogue Raisonné
to be one of several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this book you
can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book shop or you can order it
via online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can
read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this reserve
from your list.

Eric Bittinger:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or
their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic in the
park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill
your personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book could be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the publication untitled Artemisia Gentileschi and the Authority of Art:
Critical Reading and Catalogue Raisonné can be great book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Ann Foley:

The particular book Artemisia Gentileschi and the Authority of Art: Critical Reading and Catalogue
Raisonné has a lot details on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of help. The book was
compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research prior to write this book. This particular
book very easy to read you may get the point easily after perusing this book.

Christina Webb:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Artemisia Gentileschi and the Authority of
Art: Critical Reading and Catalogue Raisonné publication written by well-known writer we are excited for
well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written within good
manner for you, leaking every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still
uncertainty Artemisia Gentileschi and the Authority of Art: Critical Reading and Catalogue Raisonné as
good book not simply by the cover but also by content. This is one reserve that can break don't assess book
by its protect, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading
through sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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