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Different forms of city government are in widespread use across the United States. The two most common
structures are the mayor-council form and the council-manager form. In many large U.S. cities, there have
been passionate movements to change the structure of city governments and equally intense efforts to defend
an existing structure. Charter change (or preservation) is supported to solve problems such as legislative
gridlock, corruption, weak executive leadership, short-range policies, or ineffective delivery of services.
Some of these cities changed their form of government through referendum while other cities chose to retain
the form in use.

More than Mayor or Manager offers in-depth case studies of fourteen large U.S. cities that have considered
changing their form of government over the past two decades: St. Petersburg, Florida; Spokane, Washington;
Hartford, Connecticut; Richmond, Virginia; San Diego, California; Oakland, California; Kansas City,
Missouri; Grand Rapids, Michigan; Dallas, Texas; Cincinnati, Ohio; El Paso, Texas; Topeka, Kansas; St.
Louis, Missouri; and Portland, Oregon.

The case studies shed light on what these constitutional contests teach us about different forms of
government?the causes that support movements for change, what the advocates of change promised, what is
at stake for the nature of elected and professional leadership and the relationship between leaders, and why
some referendums succeeded while others failed. This insightful volume will be of special interest to leaders
and interest groups currently considering or facing efforts to change the form of government as well as
scholars in the field of urban studies.
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From reader reviews:

Juan Elam:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading practice
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want sense happy
read one having theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The actual More than Mayor or Manager:
Campaigns to Change Form of Government in America's Large Cities is kind of guide which is giving the
reader capricious experience.

Todd Pfeifer:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject More than Mayor or
Manager: Campaigns to Change Form of Government in America's Large Cities suitable to you? The book
was written by renowned writer in this era. Often the book untitled More than Mayor or Manager:
Campaigns to Change Form of Government in America's Large Citiesis the main one of several books which
everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this
reserve you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know previous to. The author explained their
concept in the simple way, so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will
give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world
with this book.

Margaret Morales:

A lot of book has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the most effective book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is referred
to as of book More than Mayor or Manager: Campaigns to Change Form of Government in America's Large
Cities. You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could possibly add
your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about guide. It can
bring you from one destination to other place.

Bertha Davis:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got scholars? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know
that little person just like reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book. Amount types of
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is More than Mayor or Manager: Campaigns to
Change Form of Government in America's Large Cities.
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