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The word “Mississauga” is the name British Canadian settlers used for the Ojibwe on the north of Lake
Ontario – now the most urbanized region in what is now Canada. The Ojibwe of this area in the early and
mid-nineteenth century lived through a time of considerable threat to the survival of the First Nations, as
they lost much of their autonomy, and almost all of their traditional territory.

Donald B. Smith’s Mississauga Portraits recreates the lives of eight Ojibwe who lived during this period –
all of whom are historically important and interesting figures, and seven of whom have never before received
full biographical treatment. Each portrait is based on research drawn from an extensive collection of writings
and recorded speeches by southern Ontario Ojibwe themselves, along with secondary sources. These
documents – uncovered over the 40 years that Smith has spent researching and writing about the Ojibwe –
represent the richest source of personal First Nations writing in Canada from the mid-nineteenth century.

Mississauga Portraits is a sequel to Smith’s immensely popular Sacred Feathers, which provided a detailed
biography of Mississauga chief and Methodist minister Peter Jones (1802–1856). The first chapter in
Mississauga Portraits on Jones tightly links the two books, which together give readers a vivid composite
picture of life in mid-nineteenth-century Aboriginal Canada.
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From reader reviews:

Jordan Sampson:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great and important the book Mississauga Portraits: Ojibwe Voices
from Nineteenth-Century Canada. All type of book would you see on many resources. You can look for the
internet options or other social media.

Oliver Crites:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This Mississauga Portraits: Ojibwe Voices from Nineteenth-Century Canada book is
readable by means of you who hate those straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for
enjoyable examining experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to provide to
you. The writer associated with Mississauga Portraits: Ojibwe Voices from Nineteenth-Century Canada
content conveys objective easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in
the content but it just different by means of it. So , do you continue to thinking Mississauga Portraits: Ojibwe
Voices from Nineteenth-Century Canada is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Dennis Bryant:

Why? Because this Mississauga Portraits: Ojibwe Voices from Nineteenth-Century Canada is an unordinary
book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will zap you with the secret it
inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such wonderful way
makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning
completely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This
unique book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have such as help improving your talent
and your critical thinking way. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the
guide store hurriedly.

Danielle Deguzman:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but novel and Mississauga Portraits: Ojibwe Voices from
Nineteenth-Century Canada or perhaps others sources were given understanding for you. After you know
how the fantastic a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or
perhaps students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to put their knowledge. In some other case,
beside science publication, any other book likes Mississauga Portraits: Ojibwe Voices from Nineteenth-



Century Canada to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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