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A perfect fish in the evolutionary sense, the broadbill swordfish derives its name from its distinctive
bill—much longer and wider than the bill of any other billfish—which is flattened into the sword we all
recognize. And though the majesty and allure of this warrior fish has commanded much attention—from
adventurous sportfishers eager to land one to ravenous diners eager to taste one—no one has yet been bold
enough to truly take on the swordfish as a biographer. Who better to do so than Richard Ellis, a master of
marine natural history? Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator is his masterly ode to this mighty
fighter.

The swordfish, whose scientific name means “gladiator,” can take on anyone and anything, including ships,
boats, sharks, submarines, divers, and whales, and in this book Ellis regales us with tales of its vitality and
strength. Ellis makes it easy to understand why it has inspired so many to take up the challenge of epic
sportfishing battles as well as the longline fishing expeditions recounted by writers such as Linda Greenlaw
and Sebastian Junger. Ellis shows us how the bill is used for defense—contrary to popular opinion it is not
used to spear prey, but to slash and debilitate, like a skillful saber fencer. Swordfish, he explains, hunt at the
surface as well as thousands of feet down in the depths, and like tuna and some sharks, have an unusual
circulatory system that gives them a significant advantage over their prey, no matter the depth in which they
hunt. Their adaptability enables them to swim in waters the world over—tropical, temperate, and sometimes
cold—and the largest ever caught on rod and reel was landed in Chile in 1953, weighing in at 1,182 pounds
(and this heavyweight fighter, like all the largest swordfish, was a female).

Ellis’s detailed and fascinating, fact-filled biography takes us behind the swordfish’s huge, cornflower-blue
eyes and provides a complete history of the fish from prehistoric fossils to its present-day endangerment, as
our taste for swordfish has had a drastic effect on their population the world over. Throughout, the book is
graced with many of Ellis’s own drawings and paintings, which capture the allure of the fish and bring its
splendor and power to life for armchair fishermen and landlocked readers alike.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer McMorris:

This book untitled Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator to be one of several books that best seller
in this year, here is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily
to buy this particular book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by using online. The publisher on this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Carlos Quirk:

This Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator is great e-book for you because the content which can
be full of information for you who all always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This
specific book reveal it info accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling sentences within
it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight
forward sentences but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Swordfish: A
Biography of the Ocean Gladiator in your hand like having the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous
one. We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen second right but this publication
already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt this?

Teresa Burns:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a
book. Ugh, you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
okay you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Swordfish: A
Biography of the Ocean Gladiator which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
see.

Kristi Duncan:

Some people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean
Gladiator to make your personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading skill is developing when
you similar to reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the sensation about
book and studying especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open a book and study it. Beside that
the book Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator can to be your brand-new friend when you're feel
alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of this time.



Download and Read Online Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean
Gladiator Richard Ellis #LU7569WSRAC



Read Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard
Ellis for online ebook

Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard Ellis Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books, books to
read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub, read
books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books to
read Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard Ellis books to read online.

Online Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard Ellis ebook PDF
download

Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard Ellis Doc

Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard Ellis Mobipocket

Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard Ellis EPub

Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard Ellis Ebook online

Swordfish: A Biography of the Ocean Gladiator by Richard Ellis Ebook PDF


