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Plato was the first and most formidable thinker to recognise that education is a fiercely contested concept,
and to point out what great social and personal issues are at stake in education. He articulated a compelling
argument for a liberal arts education as something peculiarly befitting free and autonomous beings. He
understood the centrality of education for human well-being and flourishing. And he was the first to set forth
a systematic theory of education.

In this text, Robin Barrow concisely and convincingly establishes the continuing relevance of Plato's views
to debates on such issues as nature vs. nurture (or genetic inheritance vs. social background), philosophy vs.
sophistry (or the pursuit of true understanding vs. the pursuit of reputation, or perhaps simply truth vs.
politics and the media). Questions concerning the fair distribution of education, moral education, value
judgments and human nature are explored along with themes more specifically associated with Plato's
philosophy such as the Theory of Ideas. The whole is embedded in a clearly presented account of the
historical background to Plato's thought.
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From reader reviews:

Antione Wilson:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book Plato (Bloomsbury Library of Educational
Thought). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. As long as we know about how is
important a book Plato (Bloomsbury Library of Educational Thought). You can add know-how and of course
you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can know everything!
From your country right up until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple matter until wonderful
thing you may know that. In this era, we can open a book or perhaps searching by internet product. It is
called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Doris Rice:

The book Plato (Bloomsbury Library of Educational Thought) make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You
need to use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make reading through a book Plato
(Bloomsbury Library of Educational Thought) to get your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your
own capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you
like start and read a publication Plato (Bloomsbury Library of Educational Thought). Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this
guide?

Clarissa Holland:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Plato (Bloomsbury
Library of Educational Thought) suitable to you? The actual book was written by well known writer in this
era. Typically the book untitled Plato (Bloomsbury Library of Educational Thought)is the one of several
books which everyone read now. That book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this
book you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know before. The author explained their thought in the
simple way, therefore all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you
a lot of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world with this book.

Bradley Printz:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Plato (Bloomsbury Library of
Educational Thought) which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.
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